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What is the quality of my forages? I had a first 
cutting on June 25. The nutritive quality of the 
standing crop declines both as it matures and as 
it is affected by spoilage miroorganisms in the 
high-humidity conditions. The greatest decline 
in quality occurs during late May through very 
early June from excellent to good, as flowers of 
legumes and seed heads of grasses form. The 
decline during the next few weeks due to further 
maturity is slower, declining from good to fair or 
low. If the forage was cut on June 25, baled, and 
stored normally, its nutritive quality could be 
from fair to low. To determine what its feeding 
value is and to know how to use it in winter 
feeding rations, you should get a forage analysis 
on a sample that represents the variability in the 
hay. Check with your local extension office or 
extension crop or livestock specialists to see how 
a sample should be taken and where to send the 
sample for analysis. Extension livestock field 
specialists can assist in interpreting the results 
and planning for the use of the forage in a feed-
ing program. 

What is the nutrient value of hay if it was cut 
and then rained on for one to two weeks 
before baling? Once the crop is cut, the forage 
becomes more susceptible to leaching of nutri-
ents and protein loss due to leaf shatter. Vita-
mins, minerals, and sugars are the first to leach 
from the curing hay. Proteins remain with the 
hay as long as the leaves remain attached. 
Legumes such as alfalfa and clover lose leaves 
more quickly than do grasses during curing and 
handling. Spoilage microorganisms are more 
abundant on hay that has been cut, so mold will 

probably be a factor in the hay when it is baled, 
stored, and fed. Cattle are generally more toler-
ant of mustiness and mold in feed than are 
horses. After a week or two of rain damage, 
nutritive value will probably be low for legumes 
and fair to low for grasses. A forage sample and 
analysis will be very helpful to know what the 
quality is and useful in building it into winter 
feeding rations. 

What about storage of wet hay? Hay baled at 
moisture contents of greater than 15 percent or 
so will heat and lose moisture during storage. 
This heating comes from the rapid growth of 
fungi and bacteria in a favorable environment 
(moisture, available carbohydrate sources, and 
oxygen). Their respiration generates heat. The 
heat will either dissipate rapidly from individual 
bales or from small, shallow stacks of bales. 
However, if the bales are dense, or stored in deep 
tight stacks, or both, the heat cannot dissipate 
rapidly, and is retained in the stack, building to 
higher temperatures. 

Hay with 15 to 20 percent moisture content will 
generally only heat to 90 to 120° F with no more 
than a minor decrease in protein digestibility— 
this is “normal curing.” However, hay stored at 
higher than 20 percent moisture will support 
fungal spoilage growth for a longer period, will 
often be musty or visibly moldy, and can have 
significant reduction in percent digestible pro-
tein, called “heat damaged protein.” If heat 
builds up in deep stacks of this wetter hay, 
temperatures can approach 140 to 150° F or 
higher. If the temperature climbs to no higher 
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than this, the stack will eventually cool off. If the 
temperature continues to rise, the local fire 
department should be notified of “hot hay.” 
Don’t begin moving bales until advised by fire 
department officials! At these temperatures, 
chemical reactions can quickly lead to further 
temperature increases to the ignition point (450 
to 525° F), hot enough to smolder and char. 
Opening the stack to oxygen can result in open 
flames. 

If hay is baled wetter than desired, storage sug-
gestions include the following: 
• Store round bales outside individually, or 

in rows, only one-bale deep until heating 
has ceased. 

• Store large, rectangular bales inside, in a well 
ventilated area, preferably off the floor, on 
pallets or tires, with spaces between bales, 
and no deeper than one-bale depth. 

• Store small, rectangular bales inside, in a well 
ventilated area, no deeper than 4 to 6 feet 
deep, preferably stacked loosely with spaces 
between bales. 

Bales can be restacked after the initial heating 
has subsided. 

Sample and test all hay to determine its nutritive 
content, and use the information to develop 
sound feeding rations. For concerns about 
mustiness and mold, consult a veterinarian. 





Accessibility Report





		Filename: 

		1858453119.pdf









		Report created by: 

		



		Organization: 

		







[Enter personal and organization information through the Preferences > Identity dialog.]



Summary



The checker found no problems in this document.





		Needs manual check: 0



		Passed manually: 2



		Failed manually: 0



		Skipped: 0



		Passed: 30



		Failed: 0







Detailed Report





		Document





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Accessibility permission flag		Passed		Accessibility permission flag must be set



		Image-only PDF		Passed		Document is not image-only PDF



		Tagged PDF		Passed		Document is tagged PDF



		Logical Reading Order		Passed manually		Document structure provides a logical reading order



		Primary language		Passed		Text language is specified



		Title		Passed		Document title is showing in title bar



		Bookmarks		Passed		Bookmarks are present in large documents



		Color contrast		Passed manually		Document has appropriate color contrast



		Page Content





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged content		Passed		All page content is tagged



		Tagged annotations		Passed		All annotations are tagged



		Tab order		Passed		Tab order is consistent with structure order



		Character encoding		Passed		Reliable character encoding is provided



		Tagged multimedia		Passed		All multimedia objects are tagged



		Screen flicker		Passed		Page will not cause screen flicker



		Scripts		Passed		No inaccessible scripts



		Timed responses		Passed		Page does not require timed responses



		Navigation links		Passed		Navigation links are not repetitive



		Forms





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Tagged form fields		Passed		All form fields are tagged



		Field descriptions		Passed		All form fields have description



		Alternate Text





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Figures alternate text		Passed		Figures require alternate text



		Nested alternate text		Passed		Alternate text that will never be read



		Associated with content		Passed		Alternate text must be associated with some content



		Hides annotation		Passed		Alternate text should not hide annotation



		Other elements alternate text		Passed		Other elements that require alternate text



		Tables





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Rows		Passed		TR must be a child of Table, THead, TBody, or TFoot



		TH and TD		Passed		TH and TD must be children of TR



		Headers		Passed		Tables should have headers



		Regularity		Passed		Tables must contain the same number of columns in each row and rows in each column



		Summary		Passed		Tables must have a summary



		Lists





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		List items		Passed		LI must be a child of L



		Lbl and LBody		Passed		Lbl and LBody must be children of LI



		Headings





		Rule Name		Status		Description



		Appropriate nesting		Passed		Appropriate nesting










Back to Top

